
RICHMOND CH SHOW 13 
VD (2) 1 Fry & Jackson’s Ch Amantra Cheers, beautifully made tri, a wonderful ambassador for the breed, at the 
age of 8 years showing that quality lasts, good sized head with lovely dome, large dark eyes, wide muzzle with 
good turn-up, excellent ribcage & width of chest, well boned straight front legs, level topline, happy disposition, 
moved & showed off his virtues to advantage. RCC & BV; 2 Sellen’s Cofton Armino at Gmacrystals, nicely 
marked blen with lovely substance & bone, good width of chest, impressive head with dark eyes & good dome.  
PD (6) 1 Schemel’s Tudorhurst Commodore, tri, clearly marked with bright tan markings, good sized head with 
large dark eyes, level topline, straight front, wonderfully outgoing personality, moved well; 2 Fry & Jackson’s 
Amantra Treasury, giving away a good deal on age, this blen has the most excellent outline with a short level 
back & good reach of neck, nicely proportioned head with good dome, nice width of muzzle, large dark eyes, 
moved steadily; 3 Pearce’s Kerizma Kestrel.  
JD (1) 1 Mochrie’s Downsbank Guthrie, excellent quality, compact tri, well made with good bone & substance, 
nice width of chest, level topline, good rear angulation, lovely head & skull, large dark eyes, in good coat, moved 
well.  
PGD (5) 1 Pennington’s Tudorhurst Corsair, gleaming black jacket on this dog with contrasting bright tan 
markings, good sized head with excellent dome & dark eyes together with good width of muzzle, well made 
body with straight front legs, nice neck & level topline producing a commanding outline, moved well; 2 
Schemel’s Von Der Gebhardshoh, tri in profuse coat, well marked, good skull & width of muzzle, large eyes, 
good bone & substance, moved well; 3 Austin’s Dragonheart Of Winter. 
 LD (4) 1 Mochrie’s Downsbank Spruce, nice sized tri, good head proportions with nice dome & large dark eyes, 
good turn up, good ribcage & strong bone & substance, well set tail; 2 Wallhead’s Sleepyhollow Trikki Dikki at 
Merida, quality dog, well marked tri with bright tan markings, good ear fringes, attractive head with open nostrils 
& nice dome, straight front, level topline, moved well.  
OD (4) 1 Moffatt & Robins’ Ch Maibee Theo, this dog has astonishing ring presence which complements his 
breed qualities superbly, lightly marked nice sized tri with level topline, well carried tail, good ribcage, strongly 
made straight front legs, good width of chest, low set ears accentuating his beautifully domed skull, large dark 
eyes, open nostrils, soft expression, moved confidently with drive, a real toy spaniel. CC & BOB; 2 Maddison’s 
Alambra Rich Ruby, well named mature dog in good coat of deep ruby colour, well balanced with good sized 
head, dark eyes, good muzzle, well built body with good ribcage & chest, strong bone, moved enthusiastically; 3 
Austin’s Dragonheart Of Winter. 



VB (1) 1 Stone’s Maynorth Simply Heavenly, b/t looking good for her age, lovely head with good dome & width 
of muzzle, large dark eyes, good body with lovely bone for her size, nice reach of neck, well fringed ears, moved 
well.  
PB (4) 1 Pennington’s Hello Dolly de la Montagne Ensoleillee of Tudorhurst, nicely balanced, lightly marked tri 
with attractive head & expression, nice nose placement, good tan markings, nice bone for size, good body & 
ribcage, level topline, good tailset, moved well. BP; 2 Dix’s Beewye Penelope Pitstop, feminine tri, very much a 
baby, good head with nice dome, dark eyes, lovely ear fringes, nice tailset, moved with enthusiasm; 3 Baker’s 
Cofton Songbird.  
JB (3) 1 Baker’s Cofton Walking On Sunshine, such a well balanced tri with a good sized head & well made 
body, excellent dome, low set ears, large dark eyes, good width of muzzle, nice neck to short level topline, 
lovely ribcage & width of chest, good tail carriage, nice ear fringes with bright tan markings, moved steadily; 2 
Gillhespy’s Lorphil Lady Godiva, very feminine lightly marked tri with a most attractive head, good skull & large 
dark eyes, nice outline with good reach of neck & level topline; 3 Juniper’s Lewiscarol Black Beauty.  
PGB (6) 1 Fry & Jackson’s Amantra Galaxy, nicely marked blen of lovely size & shape, good sized head with 
large dark eyes, nice dome & width of muzzle, nice neck to short level topline, good ribcage, well off for bone & 
substance, straight front, moved steadily; 2 Wallhead’s Baldragon Becuz I’m Worth It To Merida, clearly marked 
tri  with bright tan markings, good head with large dark eyes, good outline, outgoing temperament, moved well; 3 
Stone’s Maynorth Lovesong.  
LB (6) 1 Mochrie’s Downsbank Evensong, lovely size tri in good coat, sweet expression with good dome, wide 
muzzle, large dark eyes, lovely ribcage, heavy bone for size, compact body, nice tailset; 2 Gillhespy & McInally’s 
Braemarra Gossip Girl, lightly marked tri with a happy personality, attractive head with pleasing feminine 
expression, dark eyes, good ear fringes; bright tan markings; moved well; 3 Juniper’s Lewiscarol Lady Divine.  
OB (7) 1 Goodwin’s Ch Maibee Clementine of Lanola, lightly marked tri with great charm & quality, beautiful 
head with lovely dome, large dark eyes, nice muzzle, nice neck to short level topline, good ribcage & width of 
chest for size, strong straight front legs, nice rear angulation, good ear fringes, lovely size & outline, moved well. 
CC; 2 Dix’s Ch Paulian Prudence for Beewye, well marked tri with bright tan markings, nice overall size & 
substance, good ribcage, large dark eyes, good ear fringes. RCC; 3 Moffatt & Robins’ Maibee Emeldamay. 
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